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From: Gavin Francis

To: Donna Spinks

Cc: Grant Whatley; Lauren Hatton; RL Legal

Subject: AGS Commercial Pty Limited - Application to become Eligible Applicant for Public Examination
[SEC=OFFICIAL] [HWLE-Matter.C0190225.1065821]

Date: Monday, 21 March 2022 12:24:15 PM

Attachments: image001.png
image004.jpg

Dear Ms Spinks

Thank you for your email.

We would like to pay the filing fee by credit card.
Can you please provide an invoice addressed to:

HWL Ebsworth Lawyers
Level 14

264-278 George Street
Sydney, NSW, 2000

Upon receipt of the invoice we will organise payment today.
Thank you

Gavin Francis
Senior Associate

HWLE

Level 14, Australia Square 264-278 George Street | Sydney NSW 2000
Phone +61 2 9334 8564
afrancis@hwle.com.au | www.hwlebsworth.com.au

Full service | Commercially oriented | Unrivalled value

Adelaide | Brisbane | Canberra | Darwin | Hobart | Me bourne | Norwest | Perth | Sydney

If you receive this communication by mistake we proh bit you from using it in any way and do not waive client legal privilege. Please
notify us, delete the communication (and any attachments) and destroy all copies. We do not represent or warrant that this
communication is free from computer viruses or other defects. You are respons ble for all loss or damage caused directly or
indirectly by the use of this communication. If you do not receive all of the email or attachments please notify us immediately by
reply email. This notice should not be deleted or altered.

From: Donna Spinks <Donna.Spinks@asic.gov.au>

Sent: Monday, 21 March 2022 9:29 AM

To: Gavin Francis <gfrancis@hwle.com.au>

Cc: Grant Whatley <gwhatley@hwle.com.au>; Lauren Hatton <lhatton@hwle.com.au>; RL Legal
<RL.Legal@asic.gov.au>

Subject: FW: AGS Commercial Pty Limited - Application to become Eligible Applicant for Public
Examination [HWLE-Matter.C0190225.1065821] [SEC=OFFICIAL]

Dear Mr Francis,
Thank you for your email and the documents.

There is an application fee of $468 for this type of application. | have attached below the
ASIC document setting out the fee. Please refer to page 196 'Eligible Applicant Requests'.

(See attached file: cris-asic-industry-funding-model-2020-2 1-published-11-november-



ASIC FOI 2017-2022

2021.pdf)

There is no statutory timeframe for ASIC to make a decision in relation to an eligible
applicant request.

Please respond in writing advising whether you intend to pay the fee.
Next steps:

1. If you do not intend to pay the fee ASIC will not undertake any further steps regarding
your application.

2. If you do intend to pay the fee:
a. Please also provide your postal/residential address to assist us in preparing an
invoice.
b. We'llthen issue an invoice to you for payment.
c. ASIC will commence reviewing your application including advising, whether
we require any further information from you.

Yours sincerely
Donna Spinks

Donna Spinks

Lawyer

Registered Liquidators Team

Australian Securities and Investments Commission
Level 7, 120 Collins Street, Melbourne, 3000

Tel: +61 3 9280 4732

donna.spinks@asic.gov.au
ASIC logo

Note: | work Monday, Tuesday and Thursday, Friday

From: Gavin Francis <gfrancis@hwle.com.au>

Sent: Monday, 21 March 2022 8:41 AM

To: RL Legal <RL.Legal@asic.gov.au>

Cc: 'Grant Whatley' <grant.whatley@me.com>; Lauren Hatton </hatton@hwle.com.au>
Subject: AGS Commercial Pty Limited - Application to become Eligible Applicant for Public
Examination [HWLE-Matter.C0190225.1065821]

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Do not click any links or open any attachments unless you
trust the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir / Madam
We act for AGS Commercial Pty Limited (AGS).

We find attached our letter in which AGS makes its application to become an eligible applicant for the
public examination of relevant officers pursuant to s.596A of the Corporations Act 2001.

The following link contains the Annexures that are referred to within our attached letter;

https://docdrop.hwlebsworth.com.au/message/ZicJp5aJMqQZaC11bjRc2P
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If you have any questions, please contact our office.

We await your reply.

Regards,

Gavin Francis

Senior Associate

H LE o Level 14, Australia Square 264-278 George Street | Sydney NSW 2000
Phone +61 2 9334 8564

gfrancis@hwle.com.au | www_hwlebsworth.com.au

Full service | Commercially oriented | Unrivalled value

Adelaide | Brisbane | Canberra | Darwin | Hobart | Me bourne | Norwest | Perth | Sydney

If you receive this communication by mistake we proh bit you from using it in any way and do not waive client legal privilege. Please
notify us, delete the communication (and any attachments) and destroy all copies. We do not represent or warrant that this
communication is free from computer viruses or other defects. You are respons ble for all loss or damage caused directly or
indirectly by the use of this communication. If you do not receive all of the email or attachments please notify us immediately by
reply email. This notice should not be deleted or altered.

Please consider the environment before printing this document.

Information collected by ASIC may contain personal information. Please refer to our Privacy Policy for
information about how we handle your personal information, your rights to seek access to and correct
your personal information, and how to complain about breaches of your privacy by ASIC.

This e-mail and any attachments are intended for the addressee(s) only and may be confidential.
They may contain legally privileged, copyright material or personal and /or confidential information.
You should not read, copy, use or disclose the content without authorisation. If you have received this
email in error, please notify the sender as soon as possible, delete the email and destroy any copies.
This notice should not be removed.





